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2. CUSTOMER'S LOAD AND OPERATION (continued) 
(c) Customers with Self-Generation (continued) 

Customer to supply all equipment, including but not limited to, transfer switches, 
disconnects, overload protection, and any other protective devices necessary to safely 
connect to and operate from another power source.  The Customer shall be liable for 
all costs and liability associated with any damage or injury resulting from using 
another power source. 

 
(d) Maintenance of Customer's Facilities  

Installation and maintenance of all facilities beyond the point of delivery, except 
metering equipment, shall be at the expense and responsibility of the Customer except 
under conditions specified by the Company in writing.  If a Customer requests a 
service call and the problem is in the Customer’s facilities, the Company may charge 
for the service call as specified in Schedule 300. 

 
(e) Highly Fluctuating Loads 

If Customer uses welding machines, X-ray apparatus, elevators or other equipment 
with highly fluctuating load characteristics, or having an abnormal effect on voltage, 
and whose operation requires the Company to install transformer capacity or other 
equipment in order to protect the quality of service to other Customers or to provide 
for short period use of power by such equipment, the Company will provide service as 
described in Regulation 12. 
 
The Company reserves the right to refuse to supply service to loads of a character 
which may seriously impair service to any Customer and shall have the right to discon-
tinue service to the Customer who shall continue to use appliances or apparatus detri-
mental to the service to any customer after being notified thereof in writing by the 
Company.   
 

(f) Balancing of Load 
The Customer shall so arrange his load that there will be, at the Point of Delivery, a 
reasonable electric load balance between the phases of a polyphase circuit and between 
the two sides of a single phase three-wire circuit. 
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